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SUMMARY : The term ‘Packaging’ is no more restricted to its basic functions like containment, protection, and
preservation. Packaging plays an important and intermediate role in marketing. Packaging design must attract
consumers in today’s increasingly competitive and quickly changing market. Focusing on advanced technologies,
the packaging industry is bringing in more innovationsto meet the demands of the customers. However, these
innovations have also created a problem of accumulation of packaging solid waste in huge quantity, leading to
environmental hazards. In the current days, rise in concern over environmental hazards, eco-friendly packaging,
and waste reduction targets specified by other countries has been observed. Preventing packaging waste and
minimisingits environmental impact is a complex task. Waste prevention should not be considered solely as
qualitative and quantitative reduction of packaging materials, rather it must take account of the entire process
chain – from production, distribution and sales to use by the consumer and subsequent disposal. Most packaging
and containers are made from materials such as plastic, cardboard, glass and steel, which can be recycled easily
and effectively. Recycling packaging diverts large amounts of waste from landfill and has many other environmental
benefits. For instance, it takes about 84 per cent less energy to recycle a plastic bottle than to make one from raw
materials. However, the market for recycled plastic products is limited due to inconsistency of the raw material.
The rise in environmental consciousness in recent decades has included a focus on household waste. It is not the
most urgent of the problems we face, but it may be the most immediately accessible. Garbage disposal happens
again and again, right at home under our personal control. The problem of solid waste has expanded rapidly in
recent times; most adults today remember growing up in a world that used much less packaging. There is an
urgent need to look into some major aspects of packaging that are believed to have a negative impact on the
environment. The participation of local municipalities and consumers as well as people in industry is extremely
vital in addressing the problems impacting the environment.
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